
How I Turn 2 Cents Into $10 Over And Over
Again... At Will... And How YOU Can Too?

For the longest time, I ignored one of the busiest sites on the internet where 
people go looking for things to buy.

They go there looking for bargains, but they definitely go with their credit 
cards in hand.

That place is eBay, and if you haven't looked at it recently, you may be 
surprised.



Not only can you sell all types of physical products there, you can even sell 
DIGITAL products.

That opens up a whole new marketplace for some of us info-marketers.

There is also a newsletter capability, which lets you email all of your 
customers.

This is a super-easy way to turn one-time customers into repeat customers, 
and using a system with near 100% deliverability!  Email from eBay gets 
delivered, AND it gets OPENED :-)

I'll be sharing all of that with you in follow-up videos that I'll post to 
YouTube.

I'll teach you all about this fairly easy potential six-figure income source that 
you've probably overlooked.

In fact, several of my mentors earn seven-figures per year on eBay!

However, for now, let's just look at how I turn two cents into ten dollars... 
over and over... at will.

Those of you who have followed me for a while probably know that "I have a
green thumb."

My wife and I grow many of the fruits and vegetables that we eat.

We do that because it's relaxing, and since we don't use ANY harmful 
herbicides or pesticides, it allows us to know that our veggies are relatively 
safe.

One of the more exotic plants that we grow is called "Moringa."  





Moringa oleifera is also is called the drumstick tree, the miracle tree, the ben 
oil tree, or the horseradish tree. 

My wife, who is originally from the Philippines has cooked soups, stews and 
stir-frys with the leaves of this plant for all of the nearly 40 years that I've 
know her.

The plant is packed with an amazing number of nutrients, and is revered by 
many doctors and nutritionists.

Many herbalist also use it in treating a variety of ailments.

Anyway, I took an interest in eBay in early-January 2022.  

As I looked around and studied what others were selling, I stumbled across 
the fact that people were already selling several of the plants that I grew 
including moringa!

So I decided to do the same.  Moringa is incredibly easy to grow from 
cuttings.

You can take practically any branch of a  moringa plant, cut it into sections, 
and stick them into some potting soil, with or without a rooting hormone, and
that cutting grows roots and grows like crazy... a very high percentage of the 
time.





I started 40 or so plants from cuttings but as I studied propagation of the 
plant, I also discovered that you can easily grow them from seeds.

NOTE:  Many people selling moringa on eBay do sell just the cuttings.  The 
offer “X” number of cuttings for whatever price.  I prefer selling live, whole, 
rooted plants.  That way I know that my customer has the best chance of 
actually growing the plants larger.

On top of that, I found an eBay seller offering 1000 seeds for only $14.99

I quickly ordered 1000 moringa seeds, and planted some of them, and was 
pleasantly surprised that most of them germinated.

Conservatively assuming that only 80% of a batch of seeds germinate, I'll end
up with 800 plants, just from that first 1000 seeds.

That equates to a cost of  $.01873 per plant.

I did some price testing, listing the plants for $10 and then for $15 and was 
SURPRISED at how quickly they sold at both price points.

So, I've decided to order several thousand more seeds, and will plant them in 
succession for as long as practical.

NOTE:  Moringa likes warmer weather, so we stick some of our plants inside
our carport and "Florida room" when the temperatures drop into the 20's here 
in northwestern Florida... and they do great.

So there you have how I turn two cents into ten dollars.

I highly encourage you to research moringa yourself, and perhaps add some 
to your diet.

If you'd like to order a plant or two, my eBay listing is at:   



https://www.ebay.com/itm/363857804807

Now that I've got the eBay bug, I also have an insane number of other plants 
that I'm growing for sale.

They are at all different stages of growth, but this farm boy is growing: 
moringa, loquats, pomegranate, calamansi, pineapples, century plants, and 
magnolias for sale.  

I grow more of some than others (over 1000 loquats thus far this year), and 
do it largely because I enjoy gardening, but a mid-to-high six-figure income 
will be nothing to sneeze at either.

NOTE:  The GOV-MENT does get its share of my earnings.  eBay and other 
online marketplaces DO report your income!

I sell on eBay and also Facebook Marketplace.  

That's it for this video, but stay tuned for others where I'll teach you more of 
the ins-and-outs of being an eBayer!

To your success,
Willie Crawford
AKA "The Modern Midas"
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